
Renee van der Veen



Moses said, “Please show me your glory.”
And he said, “I will make all my goodness
pass before you and will proclaim before you
my name ‘The LORD.’ And I will be gracious
to whom I will be gracious, and will show
mercy on whom I will show mercy.



Everything that makes God, God. All His
characteristics, authority, power, wisdom –
literally the immeasurable weight and
magnitude of God – are contained within
God’s glory. Nothing is hidden or hold back.



kâbôd kâbôd

kaw-bode', kaw-bode'

properly weight; but only figuratively in a 
good sense, splendour or copiousness



And one called to another and said: “Holy, 
holy, holy is the LORD of hosts; the whole 
earth is full of his glory!”



The Glory of God is the manifest beauty of 
His Holiness.

The Glory of God is holiness of God made 
manifest. 

Holiness: infinite beauty and greatness of 
His manifold perfection.



The Glory of God is infinite beauty and 
greatness of His manifold perfection.









1. praise and worship (God).

"music is used to glorify God“

synonyms: give praise to, praise, extol, exalt, 
laud, worship, revere, reverence, venerate, 
pay homage/tribute to, honour, adore, thank, 
give thanks to, bless; archaicmagnify

"their prime purpose is to glorify God"



2. describe or represent as admirable, 
especially unjustifiably.

"a football video glorifying violence“

synonyms: ennoble, exalt, elevate, lift up, 
add dignity to, dignify, add lustre to, add 
distinction to, enhance, increase, augment, 
promote, boost; more.



Has a nation changed its gods, even though 
they are no gods? But my people have 
changed their glory for that which does not 
profit.



Then Joshua said to Achan, “My son, give 
glory to the LORD God of Israel and give 
praise to him. And tell me now what you 
have done; do not hide it from me.”



Awake, my glory! Awake, O harp and lyre! I 
will awake the dawn! (ESV)

Wake up, my soul! Wake up, harp and lyre! I 
will awake the dawn. (MKJV)



Everyone who is called by My name; for I 
have created him for My glory, I have formed 
him; yea, I have made him.



The glory that you have given me I have 
given to them, that they may be one even as 
we are one.



Body • Soul • Spirit



If you do well, will you not be accepted? And 
if you do not do well, sin is crouching at the 
door. Its desire is contrary to you, but you 
must rule over it.”



For you were bought with a price. So glorify 
God in your body.



For while bodily training is of some value, 
godliness is of value in every way, as it holds 
promise for the present life and also for the 
life to come.










