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Power of 

Identity
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Numbers 13:33 (NKJV) 33 There 
we saw the giants the 
descendants of Anak came from 
the giants); and we were like 
grasshoppers in our own sight, 
and so we were in their sight.”

Dying generation?

The fivefold ministry leaders are 
called to equip the saints for the 
work of the ministry. Yet the 
saints must realise they’re 
saints!

Saints

We mustn't only see God, we 
must see ourselves in God. 

See ourselves in God

1. Our past
2. Present failures / challenges
3. People’s opinions

See ourselves in.. 

Matthew 3:16–17 (NKJV) 16

When He had been baptized, 
Jesus came up immediately 
from the water; and behold, the 
heavens were opened to Him, 
and He saw the Spirit of God 
descending like a dove and 
alighting upon Him. 

Loving Father and son
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17 And suddenly a voice came 
from heaven, saying, “This is 
My beloved Son, in whom I am 
well pleased.”

Loving Father and son

Of condemnation? Old 
Or righteousness? New

**Who we are and how we see 
ourselves is defining for how 
we will live.

Ministry?

1. Empowers
2. Not based on performance
3. Strengthens us

Identity

A snapshot from the future.

Prophetic word

1 Timothy 1:18-19 This charge I 
commit to you, son Timothy, 
according to the prophecies 
previously made concerning 
you, that by them you may 
wage the good warfare, 

Prophetic word - warfare

having faith and a good 
conscience, which some having 
rejected, concerning the faith 
have suffered shipwreck...

Prophetic word - warfare
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2 Corinthians 3:17–18 (NKJV) 17

Now the Lord is the Spirit; and 
where the Spirit of the Lord is, 
there is liberty. 

Seeing ourselves in God

18 But we all, with unveiled 
face, beholding as in a mirror 
the glory of the Lord, are being 
transformed into the same 
image from glory to glory, just 
as by the Spirit of the Lord.

Seeing ourselves in God
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